

SANTA FE COLLEGE  
3000 N.W. 83<sup>rd</sup> Street  
Gainesville, FL 32606

OFFICE OF PURCHASING

DATE/Time: December 6, 2016 , 12:00pm

TO: All Bidders

FROM: David Shlafer, Purchasing Director 

SUBJECT: Notice of Recommended Award of ITB 03-17: Cable & Fiber Installation & Switch replacements

Please be informed that I am recommending awarding this bid to Delta Tech and Jacksonville Sound.

This notice with bid tabulation will be posted for review by interested parties for a period of 72 hours from the time indicated on this notice. Failure to file a protest within the time prescribed in section 120.57(3), Florida Statutes, shall constitute a waiver of proceedings under chapter 120, Florida Statutes.

ITB: 03-17 Cable & Fiber installation & Switch replacements	Lot 1 - Winter Break Schedule				
	Bldg N	Bldg S	Bldg Y	Bldg W	Bldg WA
Company					
Jacksonville Sound	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Delta Tech	\$ 4,741.57	\$ 4,301.57	\$ 5,809.83	\$ 4,209.83	\$ 2,449.83
	Lot 1 - NON-Winter Break Schedule				
	Bldg N	Bldg S	Bldg Y	Bldg W	Bldg WA
Jacksonville Sound	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Delta Tech	\$ 6,161.57	\$ 5,501.57	\$ 7,809.83	\$ 5,409.83	\$ 4,249.83
	Lot 2				
	Bldg S	Bldg Y	Bldg W & WA (together)		
Jacksonville Sound	\$ 8,800.00	\$ 7,350.00	\$ 14,600.00		
Delta Tech	\$ 12,679.67	\$ 11,559.59	\$ 16,898.61		
	Lot 3				
	Bldg S	Bldg Y	Bldg W		
Jacksonville Sound	\$ 10,200.00	\$ 11,200.00	\$ 3,500.00		
Delta Tech	\$ 9,240.81	\$ 10,216.68	\$ 3,055.31		
	Lot 4 - Winter Break Schedule				
	Bldg S	Bldg Y	Bldg W		
Jacksonville Sound	No Bid	\$ 38,700.00	No Bid		
Delta Tech	\$ 13,494.64	No Bid	\$ 5,537.36		
	Lot 4 - NON-Winter Break Schedule				
	Bldg S	Bldg Y	Bldg W		
Jacksonville Sound	No Bid	\$ 42,000.00	No Bid		
Delta Tech	\$ 16,449.64	No Bid	\$ 6,921.97		